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Term 4
Welcome to Term 4, we look forward to welcoming all
of our students back to school over the coming weeks.

Please read the following information carefully so you
know what to expect in term 4.

The calendar on page 2 will have all the information
families need to know for term 4.

Staggered return
Staff will be using the attached calendar to plan their
term of teaching. Class teachers will continue to work
from home and utilise zoom, Google Classroom and
Class DoJo to teach classes until the staggered return
to school starts. We appreciate the support of our
community during this time. Wherever possible,
students should remain at home until they are
scheduled to return. Any student that has to come to
school before these dates will continue to be
supervised by other staff members as per term 3.

Parents onsite
A reminder that non-essential visitors are not allowed
onsite during Level 4 learning. This means parents and
carers will still drop off students at Gate 2 and pick up
students from Gate 1 and 2 as appropriate.

Any parent or carer wishing to come onsite should
buzz the school office or ring the office on 9349 1569.

Mask
Wearing
All staff onsite are required to wear a mask at all times
indoors and outdoors, unless they are in an office by
themselves.

There is no requirement for students to wear a mask at
school, however they can if they wish.

Vaccinations
A new Public Health Order requires all people working
at a school to be vaccinated. Families should feel
reassured that all school staff working at Maroubra Bay
are vaccinated.

Kinder 2022
Do you know anyone in our local area turning 5 in
2022 that has not yet enrolled? We currently only have
two classes enrolled for Kinder next year, but we know
there are more pre-schoolers out there.

Please check out our website
https://maroubraba-p.schools.nsw.gov.au/news/2021/8
/kindergarten-2022.html for more information or email
Heidi at heidi.hutchsion1@det.nsw.edu.au if you have
any questions.

Matthew Ackerman
Principal

Our school is proudly supported
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Term 4 2021
Month Week Mon Tue Wed Thu Fri

October 1
4/10
Public Holiday

5/10
All students K-6
Learning From
Home

School open for
those who need it

6/10 7/10 8/10

October 2
11/10
All students K-6
Learning From
Home

School open for
those who need it

12/10 13/10
Parent Info
Session on Term 4
6pm

14/10 15/10
3-6 Assembly
(4A_5/6D)

October 3
18/10
K/1 Students
return to school

2/3/4/5/6  Learning
From Home

School open for
those who need it

19/10
Kinder 2022
Parent Welcome
Night 7pm

20/10 21/10 22/10
K-2 Assembly
(KB_1M_2G)

October 4
25/10
K/1/2/6 Students
return to school

3/4/5 Learning
From Home

School open for
those who need it

26/10 27/10 28/10 29/10
3-6 Assembly
(3L_5/6L)

2022 Captains EOI
due

November 5
1/11
K-6 Students at
school

2/11 3/11 4/11 5/11
K-2 Assembly
(KP_1H)

2022 Captain
Posters due

November 6
8/11
K-6 Students at
school

9/11 10/11 11/11 12/11
3-6 Assembly
(3R_5M)

2022 Captain
speeches due

November 7
15/11
K-6 Students at
school

16/11 17/11
2022 Captains
Speech Rnd 1

18/11
ICAS Maths

19/11
K-2 Assembly
(KM_2H)
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